



Maryland Grain Bids

This Report is Sponsored By:

HOSTETTER
GRAIN INC.
(610)-932-4484

Reporting Date

March 6, 2019

Cash Bids

Harvest Bids

Upper Eastern Shore

Grain	Low	High	Average
Corn No. 2	\$3.86	\$4.35	\$4.02
Wheat No. 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Barley No. 2	\$2.35	\$2.35	\$2.35
Soybeans No. 2	\$8.29	\$8.64	\$8.46

Upper Eastern Shore

Harvest	Low	High	Average	
Corn No. 2	19-Dec	\$4.02	\$4.22	\$4.07
Wheat No. 2	19-Jul	\$4.20	\$4.23	\$4.22
Barley No. 2	19-Jul	\$2.35	\$2.35	\$2.35
Soybeans No. 2	19-Nov	\$8.68	\$8.83	\$8.76

Mid Eastern Shore

Grain	Low	High	Average
Corn No. 2	\$3.86	\$4.16	\$4.01
Wheat No. 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Barley No. 2	\$2.35	\$2.35	\$2.35
Soybeans No. 2	\$8.29	\$8.64	\$8.44

Mid Eastern Shore

Harvest	Low	High	Average	
Corn No. 2	19-Dec	\$4.02	\$4.17	\$4.08
Wheat No. 2	19-Jul	\$4.20	\$4.23	\$4.22
Barley No. 2	19-Jul	\$2.35	\$2.35	\$2.35
Soybeans No. 2	19-Nov	\$8.68	\$8.82	\$8.78

Lower Eastern Shore

Grain	Low	High	Average
Corn No. 2	\$3.86	\$4.36	\$4.13
Wheat No. 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Barley No. 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Soybeans No. 2	\$8.59	\$8.79	\$8.69

Lower Eastern Shore

Harvest	Low	High	Average	
Corn No. 2	19-Dec	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Wheat No. 2	19-Jul	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Barley No. 2	19-Jul	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Soybeans No. 2	19-Nov	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Central Md

Grain	Low	High	Average
Corn No. 2	\$3.76	\$4.00	\$3.88
Wheat No. 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Barley No. 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Soybeans No. 2	\$8.59	\$8.59	\$8.59

Central Md

Harvest	Low	High	Average	
Corn No. 2	19-Dec	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Wheat No. 2	19-Jul	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Barley No. 2	19-Jul	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Soybeans No. 2	19-Nov	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Western Md

Grain	Low	High	Average
Corn No. 2	\$4.00	\$4.30	\$4.12
Wheat No. 2	\$4.10	\$5.54	\$4.78
Barley No. 2	\$3.15	\$4.00	\$3.46
Soybeans No. 2	\$8.28	\$8.66	\$8.46

Western Md

Harvest	Low	High	Average	
Corn No. 2	19-Dec	\$4.05	\$4.15	\$4.10
Wheat No. 2	19-Jul	\$4.80	\$4.88	\$4.84
Barley No. 2	19-Jul	\$3.25	\$3.25	\$3.25
Soybeans No. 2	19-Nov	\$8.63	\$8.90	\$8.77

State Average

Grain	Today's			Last Week Average	Compared to Last Week	Avg Last	
	Low	High	Average			Month	Year
Corn No. 2	\$3.76	\$4.36	\$4.05	\$4.07	(\$0.03)	\$4.11	\$3.99
Wheat No. 2	\$4.35	\$5.54	\$4.78	\$5.32	(\$0.54)	\$5.34	\$4.88
Barley No. 3	\$2.35	\$4.00	\$2.69	\$2.63	\$0.06	\$2.69	\$2.71
Soybeans No. 2	\$8.28	\$8.79	\$8.48	\$8.56	(\$0.08)	\$8.27	\$9.85

