



Maryland Grain Bids

Cash Bids

12/20/2017

Harvest Bids

Upper Eastern Shore

Grain	Low	High	Average
Corn No. 2	\$3.33	\$3.77	\$3.60
Wheat No. 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Barley No. 3	\$2.25	\$2.25	\$2.25
Soybeans No. 2	\$8.76	\$8.86	\$8.83

Upper Eastern Shore

Harvest	Low	High	Average
Corn No. 2 18-Dec	\$3.80	\$4.01	\$3.86
Wheat No. 2 18-Jul	\$4.02	\$4.03	\$4.02
Barley No. 3 18-Jul	\$2.25	\$2.25	\$2.25
Soybeans No. 2 18-Nov	\$9.17	\$9.17	\$9.17

Mid Eastern Shore

Grain	Low	High	Average
Corn No. 2	\$3.58	\$3.78	\$3.69
Wheat No. 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Barley No. 3	\$2.25	\$2.25	\$2.25
Soybeans No. 2	\$8.76	\$8.96	\$8.84

Mid Eastern Shore

Harvest	Low	High	Average
Corn No. 2 18-Dec	\$3.80	\$4.01	\$3.87
Wheat No. 2 18-Jul	\$4.02	\$4.03	\$4.02
Barley No. 3 18-Jul	\$2.25	\$2.25	\$2.25
Soybeans No. 2 18-Nov	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Lower Eastern Shore

Grain	Low	High	Average
Corn No. 2	\$3.63	\$3.88	\$3.78
Wheat No. 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Barley No. 3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Soybeans No. 2	\$8.96	\$9.11	\$9.04

Lower Eastern Shore

Harvest	Low	High	Average
Corn No. 2 18-Dec	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Wheat No. 2 18-Jul	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Barley No. 3 18-Jul	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Soybeans No. 2 18-Nov	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Central Md

Grain	Low	High	Average
Corn No. 2	\$3.23	\$3.70	\$3.46
Wheat No. 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Barley No. 3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Soybeans No. 2	\$8.60	\$8.81	\$8.71

Central Md

Harvest	Low	High	Average
Corn No. 2 18-Dec	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Wheat No. 2 18-Jul	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Barley No. 3 18-Jul	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Soybeans No. 2 18-Nov	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Western Md

Grain	Low	High	Average
Corn No. 2	\$3.47	\$3.75	\$3.68
Wheat No. 2	\$4.30	\$4.59	\$4.44
Barley No. 3	\$2.85	\$3.00	\$2.96
Soybeans No. 2	\$8.68	\$9.25	\$8.84

Western Md

Harvest	Low	High	Average
Corn No. 2 18-Dec	\$3.85	\$3.85	\$3.85
Wheat No. 2 18-Jul	\$4.45	\$4.45	\$4.45
Barley No. 3 18-Jul	\$2.60	\$2.60	\$2.60
Soybeans No. 2 18-Nov	\$9.50	\$9.50	\$9.50

State Average

Grain	Today's Low	Today's High	Today's Average	Last Week Average	Compared to Last Week	Avg Last Month	Avg Last Year
Corn No. 2	\$3.23	\$3.88	\$3.66	\$3.63	\$0.03	\$3.66	\$3.63
Wheat No. 2	\$3.77	\$4.59	\$4.44	\$4.43	\$0.01	\$4.44	\$4.43
Barley No. 3	\$2.25	\$3.00	\$2.57	\$2.57	(\$0.00)	\$2.57	\$2.40
Soybeans No. 2	\$8.60	\$9.25	\$8.85	\$9.03	(\$0.18)	\$8.85	\$8.98

